
       

   STEWARD’S REPORT 

 

Angle Park 

Thursday 25 September 2014 

  Weather Condition: OVERCAST 
 Track Condition: GOOD 

   

 
-WREX BALE and VALLADARES began slowly. On the first turn NEBULA moved down checking WREX BALE, SCREAMIN’, 
VALLADARES and BRONEEE. On the turn off the back straight OSBOURNE BALE moved down checking BRONEEE causing BRONEEE 
to hit the running rail. Along the home straight HONKY TONK DOLL moved out checking WREX BALE. BRONEEE vetted after the race NO 
INJURY DETECTED. 
                
 
 
 
 
-STORM ALLEN began slowly. On the first turn SPARE WHEEL moved out checking MADISON MCLAREN. Along the back straight 
MADISON MCLAREN ran wide. On the turn into the home straight MADISON MCLAREN ran wide. MADISON MCLAREN vetted after the 
race NO INJURY DETECTED. Stewards’ spoke to the trainer of MADISON MCLAREN regarding the greyhound’s performance. 
                
 
 
 
 
-COSMO KRAMER and ALLEN NAMOR began slowly. Approaching the winning post GRANDE TO EXCEL moved down checking ZAC 
BALE and BLACK BOTTLE. On the first turn COSMO KRAMER ran wide. Along the back straight ZAC BALE checked off ALLEN NAMOR 
checking COSMO KRAMER and KISAI BLADE ran wide. BLACK BOTTLE vetted after the race NO INJURY DETECTED. 
                
 
 
 
 
 

-TOKEN SPINNER began slowly. Shortly after the start TOKEN SPINNER moved out checking DEFIB DARYL and WIREGRASS moved 
out checking YODA BALE. On the first turn POWER MERC moved out checking BAZZ WILL ROCK then WIREGRASS moved out 
checking TOKEN SPINNER and YODA BALE. Along the home straight WIREGRASS moved out checking BAZZ WIILL ROCK. BAZZ WILL 
ROCK vetted after the race NO INJURY DETECTED. WIREGRASS vetted after the race NO INJURY DETECTED. DEFIB DARYL vetted 
after the race FOUND TO BE INJURED AND SUSPENDED FOR 10 DAYS ALL TRACKS. 
                
 
 
 
 
 
-ANIMATE began slowly. Shortly after the start VICTA SCOTT moved down checking DYNA DAINA and PIERO. On the turn into the home 
straight the first time DYNA DAINA moved out checking CRASH DOOLEY. On the turn into the home straight the final time DOONA BALE 
moved out checking VICTA SCOTT. 
                
 
 
 
 
-ABSOLUTE BOSS began slowly. On the turn into the back straight SPOT GOES RACING moved out checking BIG MICK DEE. Along the 
back straight VICTA BROOKE moved out checking STUZZICHINO. On the turn off the back straight BIG MICK DEE moved down checking 
SPOT GOES RACING, SADIE’S GUESS, and ABSOLUTE BOSS, shortly after STUZZICHINO moved out checking VICTA BROOKE and 
SPOT GOES RACING. 
                

RACE 1     FIND GRSA ON FACEBOOK STAKE   6.44pm 515m              Grade 4/5 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S GILBERT ALLEN  SUSP APM 22/9  3 MONTHS ALL TRACKS 

RACE 2    MCQUEENS TAVERN STAKE    7.05pm 515m  Grade 6 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S NIL 

RACE 3    GRSA.COM.AU STAKE     7.25pm 515m           Grade 5 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S NIL 

RACE 4     GAP RACING TO RETIREMENT STAKE   7.44pm 515m  Grade 5 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S ALEN CYDAN   INJURY   10 DAYS ALL TRACKS 
    DYNA ERWIN   INJURY   10 DAYS ALL TRACKS 

RACE 5   ONLY AT THE DOGS STAKE    8.08pm      600m           Grade 3/4/5 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S HESSION BOOTS GAINED START FROM RES25/9 NO PENALTY 
    WHIP COOL   INJURY   10 DAYS ALL TRACKS 

RACE 6      WINE WISE (S.A OWNED) STAKE    8.28pm 515m   Grade 5 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S DEE DEE CORSAIR  INJURY   10 DAYS ALL TRACKS 



 
 
 
 
-GENGHIS KAHN began slowly. On the first turn KALDEN GAMBINO moved down checking SIDNEY’S SHADOW, SMASH CRASH, 
SISCO GOOD and SPORTING TEARS causing SIDNEY’S SHADOW and SMASH CRASH to fall. SIDNEY’S SHADOW vetted after the 
race NO INJURY DETECTED.SMASH CRASH vetted after the race FOUND TO INJURED AND SUSPENDED 10 DAYS ALL TRACKS. 
SISCO GOOD vetted after the race FOUND TO BE INJURED AND SUSPENDED 14 DAYS ALL TRACKS. 
                
 
 
 
 
 

-Shortly after the start PREMIER EVENT moved out checking ALLEN ILLEM. On the first turn BRENT BALE moved out checking SENNI 
TONY and SHIMMERING HOOD. On the turn into the back straight SENNI TONY moved down checking ALLEN ILLEM. On the turn into 
the home straight SENNI TONY moved out checking BRENT BALE.  
                
 
 
 
 
-On the turn into the back straight SHEZA TEN moved out checking PSYCHOTIC GOLD and VICTA VICTORIA. Approaching the turn into 
the home straight SHEZA TEN moved down checking ZARA MCLAREN. 
                
 
 
 
 
-Shortly after the start SISCO FIASCO moved down checking DAZZLE ALLEN and MANIC. On the first turn DECKO BALE moved out 
checking VELOCITY SAPHIRE. 
                
 
 
 
 
-Shortly after the start SHAYNE BALE moved down checking MAX ROCKS and VELOCITY DAFF. On the turn into the home straight MAX 
ROCKS moved out checking VELOCITY DAFF, POP’S CASTLE, SHAYNE BALE and RAPIDO GRIS. 
                
     

-         SISCO GOOD  14 DAYS ALL TRACKS    
 SMASH CRASH 10 DAYS ALL TRACKS     
 DEFIB DARYL 10 DAYS ALL TRACKS 

                
 

- SHADY DEAL  RACE 3 
                
     
    - 
 
 
 

Injured In Running 

Suspensions 

RACE 7  CASH UP YOUR CLUB @ GRSA MIXED STAKE  8.52pm 515m           Grade 1/2/3 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S NIL 

RACE 8     MACRO MEATS GRADE 4 SERIES FINAL    9.11pm 515m  Grade 4 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S LUKEY DEEZ   INJURY   10 DAYS ALL TRACKS 
    COOL GUINNESS  INJURY   10 DAYS ALL TRACKS  

RACE 9    ANGLE PARK VET CLINIC FREE FOR ALL  9.35pm 731m            FFA 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S JACKO LANKAN  SUSP APM 22/9  14 DAYS ALL TRACKS 

RACE 10 ORANGE BOX RECORDS STAKE    9.54pm 515m   Grade 6 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S QUERY BALE   INJURY   10 DAYS ALL TRACKS 

Swabs Taken 

RACE 11    BAYER – ADVOCATE STAKE    10:14pm 515m        Grade 5 

EARLY SCRATCHING’S NIL 


